
LOCATION VENDOR ADDRESS PRICE
Sechelt/Sunshine Coast WTM Recycling Services 1178 Stewart Rd. Gibsons, BC V0N 1V0 36.00$      

Lower Mainland Salvage JK Japanese Auto Parts Ltd 13191 Mitchell Road, Richmond, BC V6V 1M7 709.99$    

Fraser Valley Salvage JK Japanese Auto Parts Ltd 13191 Mitchell Road, Richmond, BC V6V 1M7 624.49$    

Hope  Schnitzer Steel Canada Ltd 12195 Musqueam Dr, Surrey, BC V3V 3T2 258.63$    

Chilliwack 0803589 B.C. LTD dba Empire Abbotsford Recycled Auto Parts 1210 Sumas Way, Abbotsford, BC V2S 8H2 487.78$    

Mission Schnitzer Steel Canada Ltd 12195 Musqueam Dr, Surrey, BC V3V 3T2 498.21$    

Maple Ridge 0803589 B.C. LTD dba Empire Abbotsford Recycled Auto Parts 1210 Sumas Way, Abbotsford, BC V2S 8H2 575.90$    

Kamloops Central Salvage Group 6831 Heffley Road, Kamloops, BC, V2H 0B4 227.25$    

Merritt D&M Auto Recycling 1676 Shuswap Ave, Lumby, BC 25.20$      

Chase Garrick Automotive Ltd. Box 350, Chase, BC, V0E-1M0 27.00$      

Ft. Nelson NO BID
Ft. St. John ABC Recycling (Kelowna) Ltd 3258 Hwy 97 N, Kelowna, BC V1X 5C1 157.50$    

Dawson Creek Belsum Auto Recyclers Box 241, STN Main, Dawson Creek, BC V1G 4G7 31.50$      

McBride/Valemount NO BID
Prince Rupert NO BID
Kitimat/Terrace ABC Recycling (Kelowna) Ltd 3258 Hwy 97 N, Kelowna, BC V1X 5C1 212.96$    

Hazelton Aurora Truck Centre 2206 N Nadina Avenue, Houston, BC V0J 1Z1 27.00$      

Houston/Burns Lake Aurora Truck Centre 2206 N Nadina Avenue, Houston, BC V0J 1Z1 27.00$      

Smithers/Telkwa Aurora Truck Centre 2206 N Nadina Avenue, Houston, BC V0J 1Z1 27.00$      

Fraser Lake/Fort St. James/Vanderhoof Komar Enterprises Ltd Box 956, Fort St. James, BC V0J 1P0 42.54$      

Cache Creek/Spences Bridge/Lillooet Garrick Automotive Ltd. Box 350, Chase, BC, V0E-1M0 27.00$      

Mackenzie NO BID
Chetwynd NO BID
Haida Gwaii NO BID
Clearwater/Barriere/Avola Clearwater Towing Ltd. PO BOX 278 - 516 Swanson Rd, Clearwater, BC V0E 1N0 117.00$    

Williams Lake/150 Mile Central Salvage Group 6831 Heffley Road, Kamloops, BC, V2H 0B4 137.25$    

Clinton/Lac La Hache/100 Mile House GT Auto Recyclers Ltd Box 1390, 100 Mile House, BC, V0K 2E0 136.80$    

Quesnel ABC Recycling (Kelowna) Ltd 3258 Hwy 97 N, Kelowna, BC V1X 5C1 132.97$    

Prince George ABC Recycling (Kelowna) Ltd 3258 Hwy 97 N, Kelowna, BC V1X 5C1 211.23$    

Vernon Schnitzer Steel Canada dba Pick N Pull 1516 Stevens Road, Kelowna, BC, V1Z 1G2 368.58$    

Kelowna Schnitzer Steel Canada dba Pick N Pull 1516 Stevens Road, Kelowna, BC, V1Z 1G2 432.86$    

Salmon Arm/Sicamous D&M Auto Recycling 1676 Shuswap Ave, Lumby, BC 93.60$      

Penticton Schnitzer Steel Canada dba Pick N Pull 1516 Stevens Road, Kelowna, BC, V1Z 1G2 368.58$    

Summerland Schnitzer Steel Canada dba Pick N Pull 1516 Stevens Road, Kelowna, BC, V1Z 1G2 300.01$    

Princeton Action Steel Sales (Okanagan) Ltd 2365 Barnes St, Penticton, BC V2A 7K6 171.90$    

Grand Forks/Christina Lake J.D. Towing Inc 6585 Industrial Park Way, Grand Forks, BC V0H 1H0 238.50$    

Nelson Scrap King Autowrecking & Towing Ltd PO Box 786, 1660 Airport Rd, Salmo BC V0G 1Z0 247.55$    

Cranbrook/Kimberly Farbrook Auto Wrecking 1979 Ltd 823 6th St NW Cranbrook, BC  V1C 5L3 34.74$      

Golden Kool Country Towing & Auto Wrecking Ltd 150 Industrial Road 2, Invermere, BC V0A 1K5 43.20$      

Invermere/Canal Flats/ Radium Kool Country Towing & Auto Wrecking Ltd 150 Industrial Road 2, Invermere, BC V0A 1K5 55.80$      

Lake Country ABC Recycling (Kelowna) Ltd 3258 Hwy 97 N, Kelowna, BC V1X 5C1 360.00$    

Revelstoke D&M Auto Recycling 1676 Shuswap Ave, Lumby, BC 46.80$      

Osoyoos/Oliver/Keremeos Action Steel Sales (Okanagan) Ltd 2365 Barnes St, Penticton, BC V2A 7K6 233.99$    

Trail Ernie's Towing Inc 4801 Minto Road, Castlegar, BC V1N 4C1 294.29$    

Rock Creek J.D. Towing Inc 6585 Industrial Park Way, Grand Forks, BC V0H 1H0 238.50$    

Salmo Scrap King Autowrecking & Towing Ltd PO Box 786, 1660 Airport Rd, Salmo BC V0G 1Z0 247.53$    

Lumby Knox Mountain Metals (2020) Ltd 930 Bay Ave, Kelowna, BC V1Y 7K4 110.84$    

Castlegar Ernie's Towing Inc 4801 Minto Road, Castlegar, BC V1N 4C1 294.29$    

Nakusp/New Denver/Burton Smokey Creek Salvage Box 96, South Slocan, BC V0G 2G0 24.54$      

Creston Scrap King Autowrecking & Towing Ltd PO Box 786, 1660 Airport Rd, Salmo BC V0G 1Z0 112.53$    

Sparwood/Fernie/Elko/Jaffray Power Auto Recycling 1007 Sgt. Wilde Rd, Box 151, Ft. MacLeod, AB T0L 0Z0 33.11$      

Victoria Schnitzer Steel Canada Ltd 12195 Musqueam Dr, Surrey, BC V3V 3T2 466.98$    

Nanaimo 402530 BC Ltd. dba Highway 4 Auto Salvage 2540 Alberni Hwy, Coombs, BC B0R 1M0 559.80$    

Campbell River Schnitzer Steel Canada Ltd 12195 Musqueam Dr, Surrey, BC V3V 3T2 500.55$    

Courtenay 402530 BC Ltd. dba Highway 4 Auto Salvage 2540 Alberni Hwy, Coombs, BC B0R 1M0 469.80$    

Duncan Schnitzer Steel Canada Ltd 12195 Musqueam Dr, Surrey, BC V3V 3T2 493.80$    

Port Alberni 402530 BC Ltd. dba Highway 4 Auto Salvage 2540 Alberni Hwy, Coombs, BC B0R 1M0 337.50$    

Port Hardy 402530 BC Ltd. dba Highway 4 Auto Salvage 2540 Alberni Hwy, Coombs, BC B0R 1M0 112.50$    

Powell River Schnitzer Steel Canada Ltd 12195 Musqueam Dr, Surrey, BC V3V 3T2 30.03$      

Ucluelet/Tofino NO BID
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