RVP Price June 6, 2022

VENDOR

REGION/LOCATION

ADDRESS

Price Effective
June 6, 2022

Lower Mainland Region

JK JAPANESE USED AND NEW AUTO

Lower Mainland Salvage

PARTS LTD 13191 Mitchell Road, Richmond BC V6V 1M7 $ 619.99
W.T.M. RECYCLING SERVICES LTD. Sechelt/ Sunshine Coast 1178 Stewart Road, Gibsons BC, VON 1V7 $ 45.45
Fraser Valley
SAVE ON PARTS AUTO WRECKING LTD |[Fraser Valley Salvage Facilities 10535 120th St, Surrey BC, V3V 4G4 $ 592.20
0803589 B.C. LTD DBA EMPIRE
ABBOTSFORD RECYCLED AUTO PARTS . 1210 Sumas Way, Abbotsford BC, V2S 8H2 $ 503.90
0803589 B.C. LTD DBA EMPIRE
ABBOTSFORD RECYCLED AUTO PARTS N 1210 Sumas Way, Abbotsford BC, V2S 8H2 $ 512.90
SAVE ON PARTS AUTO WRECKING LTD [Hope 10535 120th St, Surrey BC, V3V 4G4 $ 351.00
Interior/Northern Interior
GARRICK AUTOMOTIVE LTD Cache Creek/Spences Bridge/Lillooet PO Box 350, 117 Aylmer Road, Chase BC, VOE 1MO $ 40.50
0874018 BC LTD (TOYODA 4WD) Chase 474 Chilcotin Rd, Kamloops BC, V2H 1G3 $ 45.90
BELSUM AUTO RECYCLERS 101 BC Highway 49 Box 241 Station Main Dawson Creek, BC 5 22.50
Chetwynd V1G 4G7
CLEARWATER TOWING LTD. Clearwater/Barriere/Avola PO Box 278, 516 Swanson Road, Clearwater, BC VOE 1E0 | $ 126.00
GT AUTO RECYCLERS LTD Clinton/Lac La Hache/100 Mile House PO Box 1390, 301 Moore Ave/100 Mile HOUSG, BC VOK 2EO $ 113.40
BELSUM AUTO RECYCLERS 101 BC Highway 49 Box 241 Station Main Dawson Creek, BC s 22.50
Dawson Creek V1G 4G7
ABC RECYCLING LTD Fort St. John 8081 Meadow Ave, Burnaby, BC V3N 2V9 $ 184.50

NO BID

Fort Nelson

KOMAR ENTERPRISES LTD.

Fraser Lake/FS James/Vanderhoof

PO Box 956, 1300 Tachie Road, Fort St. James, BC V0J 1P0

$ 50.00




NO BID Haida Gwaii
NO BID Hazelton
CORY'S UPTOWN AUTOMOTIVE LTD.  |Houston/Burns Lake 1810 Peterson Road, Burns Lake, BC VO0J 1E3 $ 27.00
CENTRAL SALVAGE LTD. Kamloops 717 Carrier Street, Kamloops BC, V2H 1G1 $ 258.30
ABC RECYCLING LTD Kitimat/Terrace 8081 Meadow Ave, Burnaby, BC V3N 2V9 $ 184.50
NO BID Mackenzie
NO BID McBride/Valemount
SAVE ON PARTS AUTO WRECKING LTD ([Merritt 10535 120th St, Surrey BC, V3V 4G4 $ 193.50
ABC RECYCLING LTD Prince George 8081 Meadow Ave, Burnaby, BC V3N 2V9 $ 274.50
SIXTEEN SERVICE LTD. Prince Rupert PO Box 955, Prince Rupert, BC V8J 4B7 $ 43.20
ABC RECYCLING LTD Quesnel 8081 Meadow Ave, Burnaby, BC V3N 2V9 $ 172.80
CORY'S UPTOWN AUTOMOTIVE LTD. Smithers/Telkwa 1810 Peterson Road, Burns Lake, BC V0J 1E3 $ 27.00
CENTRAL SALVAGE LTD. Williams Lake/150 Mile House 717 Carrier Street, Kamloops BC, V2H 1G1 $ 166.50
Southern Interior
SMOKEY CREEK SALVAGE LTD. Castlegar 3453 Yeatman Rd, South Slocan, BC VOG 2G0 $ 226.49
SMOKEY CREEK SALVAGE LTD. Trail 3453 Yeatman Rd, South Slocan, BC VOG 2G0 $ 226.49
SMOKEY CREEK SALVAGE LTD. Nelson 3453 Yeatman Rd, South Slocan, BC VOG 2G0 $ 239.99
FARBROOK AUTO WRECKING (1979) LTD. ) 823 6th Street NW, Cranbrook, BC V1C 5L3 $ 22.50
Cranbrook/Kimberly
SCRAP KING AUTOWRECKING & TOWING PO Box 786, Salmo BC VOG 120 s 50.65
LTD. Creston
SCRAP KING AUTOWRECKING & TOWING PO Box 786, Salmo BC VOG 120 5 211.15
LTD. Salmo
KOOL COUNTRY TOWING & AUTO .
WRECKING LTD. Golden 150 Industrial Road 2, Invermere BC, VOA 1K5 $ 40.50
ACTION STEEL SALES (OKANAGAN) LTD. o 2365 Barnes St, Penticton BC, V2A 7K6 $ 229.49
Grand Forks/Christina Lake
KOOL COUNTRY TOWING & AUTO 150 Industrial Road 2, Invermere BC, VOA 1K5 $ 54.00

WRECKING LTD.

Invermere/Canal Flats/Radium




SCHNITZER STEEL DBA PICK N PULL |Kelowna 1516 Stevens Road, Kelowna BC, V1Z 1G2 $ 407.14
ABC RECYCLING LTD Lake Country 8082 Meadow Ave, Burnaby, BC V3N 2V9 $ 360.00
SMOKEY CREEK SALVAGE LTD. Nakusp/New Denver/Burton 3453 Yeatman Rd, South Slocan, BC VOG 2G0 $ 11.48
ACTION STEEL SALES (OKANAGAN) LTD. ) 2365 Barnes St, Penticton BC, V2A 7K6 $ 305.99
Osoyoos/Oliver/Keremeos
SCHNITZER STEEL DBA PICK N PULL  |penticton 1516 Stevens Road, Kelowna BC, V1Z 1G2 $ 364.28
ACTION STEEL SALES (OKANAGAN) LTD. Princeton 2365 Barnes St, Penticton BC, V2A 7K6 $ 203.41
OLIVER RECYCLING & SALVAGE LTD. |rock Creek 5481 Sawmill Rd, Oliver, BC VOH 1T9 $ 149.99
SHUSHWAP AUTOPARTS LTD. Revelstoke 4751 5th Ave SW, Salmon Arm BC, V1E 4M2 $ 49.50
FARBROOK AUTO WRECKING (1979) LTD. . 823 6th Street NW, Cranbrook, BC V1C 5L3 $ 22.50
Sparwood/Fernie/Elko/J]affray
ACTION STEEL SALES (OKANAGAN) LTD. summerland 2365 Barnes St, Penticton BC, V2A 7K6 $ 297.91
SCHNITZER STEEL DBA PICK N PULL |vernon 1516 Stevens Road, Kelowna BC, V1Z 1G2 $ 342.00
D&M AUTO RECYCLING LTD Lumby 1676 Shuswap Ave, Lumby BC, VOE 2G0 $ 87.30
D&M AUTO RECYCLING LTD Salmon Arm/Sicamous 1676 Shuswap Ave, Lumby BC, VOE 2G0 $ 92.70
Vancouver Island

SCHNITZER STEEL CANADA LTD. Campbell River 12195 Musqueam Dr, Surrey, BC V3V 3T2 $ 488.22

402530 BC LTD. DBA HIGHWAY 4 AUTO .
SALVAGE Courtenay 2540 Alberni Hwy, Coombs BC, VOR 1MO0 $ 457.20
SCHNITZER STEEL CANADA LTD. Duncan 12195 Musqueam Dr, Surrey, BC V3V 3T2 $ 497.87

402530 BC LTD. DBA HIGHWAY 4 AUTO .
SALVAGE Nanaimo 2540 Alberni Hwy, Coombs BC, VOR 1MO0 $ 547.20

402530 BC LTD. DBA HIGHWAY 4 AUTO .
SALVAGE Port Alberni 2540 Alberni Hwy, Coombs BC, VOR 1M0 $ 333.00

402530 BC LTD. DBA HIGHWAY 4 AUTO .
SALVAGE Port Hardy 2540 Alberni Hwy, Coombs BC, VOR 1M0 $ 157.50
SCHNITZER STEEL CANADA LTD. Powell River 12195 Musqueam Dr, Surrey, BC V3V 3T2 $ 35.87

NO BID Ucluelet/Tofino

SCHNITZER STEEL CANADA LTD. Victoria 12195 Musqueam Dr, Surrey, BC V3V 3T2 $ 460.22
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